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Lesson 10 Sample Prayer 
 
Father,  
 
I praise Thee for the opportunity to talk with Thee about other people and how they 
affect me and my inner world. I choose to counsel myself with the truth - that I am 
not in charge of what others do, feel or say. I know it is easy to say those words, but 
sometimes it is hard to actually live those words, because of how much I care about 
the people in my life.  
 
I praise Thee to know that I am not the solution for anyone, only Jesus Christ is the 
solution. He is the only source of truth, and anyone in my life I might be having a 
hard time with, I know He is the only one who can truly help them. I am not their 
Savior; HE is the only one who can save. I praise Thee for the opportunity to use 
this time as a chance to spiritually focus, and to point them to THEE as the spirit 
directs me. I recognize that the people in my life have all made choices in order to be 
where they are today. Help me to be a light to them, if they are having a hard time, 
and look for the opportunity to counsel them with the truth as the spirit directs. I 
praise Thee for the stewardship opportunity I have to point them back to THEE to 
find their answers.  
 
I praise Thee for my family. The world we live in can feel so dark and overcome with 
anger. I know the greatest work I can do right now is with my family. Help open my 
eyes to see how I can love them more, how I can serve them more, from the source 
of pure love in my heart that only comes from Thee? I praise Thee to know that one 
day, all wicked influences will be overruled and everyone in my family will have a 
chance to feel the confirmations of the spirit in their lives.  
 
I praise Thee for the covenants I have made with Thee, and how those covenants 
give me power and strength. I praise Thee that the people in my life will be able to 
feel the tentacles of Divine providence because of Thy love for them. I know Thou 
loves them more than I ever could and Thou knows how to love them in the best 
way. Help me to be an instrument in Thy hands in order to love them the way Thou 
shows me.  
 
I praise Thee for the power of prayer, especially for the power of prayer for the 
people in my life. I pray for each of them by name (list them by name). I praise Thee 
for each of them. I praise Thee for Thy spiritual influence over them and know they 
can receive guidance and power from THEE.  
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The tentacles of Divine Providence is spiritual power and I pray for Thee to reach 
everyone in my life and help them to turn to Thee for their support and answers. 
Help me to know my stewardship assignments and how to carry them out. I praise 
Thee, with the fulness of my heart, for the opportunity to pray for the people in my 
life that I care about so much. Hear my prayer.  I know the worth of their souls are 
great in Thy sight.  
 
I praise Thee for the chance to grow in this life! I praise Thee that I can choose to 
look on improvement with a joyful perspective. I ask Thee to help me to keep 
looking to Thee for help in my weaknesses and to keep feeling the spirit with me, 
even when I fall short. I praise Thee that I can use my freedom to look for the good, 
and I can use the power of freedom to stand up for truth and righteousness.  
 
I praise Thee for Thy love for me, and helping me to become like Thee, as I strive to 
become like Jesus Christ. I choose to use the power of my agency to be a positive 
influence in other’s lives, and I know the worth of my soul is great in Thy sight, and 
that Thou art so happy when I choose to keep turning to Thee for help.  
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